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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Contruction Equipment

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 20, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

1 ea. *    

Tractor, Loader, enclosed canopy with detachable tiller attachment, per UNIT PRICE 40,606.47  

specifications TOTAL NO BID 40,606.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL John Deere 5053E

A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS  

17 ea. *  

Tractor, two-wheel drive with ROPS/FOPS canopy, front-mounted bucket and rear UNIT PRICE 59,399.00    68,495.00 66,517.00    67,800.00

mounted extendible backhoe, (platform type) complete, per specifications TOTAL 1,009,783.00 NO BID NO BID  NO BID 1,164,415.00 1,130,789.00 NO BID  NO BID 1,152,600.00

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL New Holland B95C  

Does Not Meet

Specifications

2017 Caterpillar

420F2

Case 580 Super N

Extendahoe  

Does Not Meet

Specifications  John Deere 310SL

B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS By: 8/25/17    135 days 170 days    60-80 days

*   

1 ea. UNIT PRICE 54,564.00 68,200.00 63,253.23  57,317.00 81,049.00  Does Not Meet 62,713.52

Compact Track Loader, complete, per specifications TOTAL 54,564.00 68,200.00 63,253.23  NO BID NO BID 57,317.00 81,049.00 NO BID Specifications 62,713.52

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL New Holland C238

John Deere 331G

Skid Steer

Bobcat T750 T4

Track Loader Not Approved

Case TV380

compact track loader Kubota SVL95-2   

John Deere 331G

Skid Steer

C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS By: 8/25/17   30-90 days 170 days    30-45 days

2 ea. *

Rubber track zero turn swing mini excavator with attachment, complete, per UNIT PRICE 39,319.00 54,450.00 41,812.98 71,115.05 41,848.00 48,700.00 43,098.00  48,494.67 53,563.68 53,151.25

specifications TOTAL 78,638.00 108,900.00 83,625.96 142,230.10 83,696.00 97,400.00 86,196.00 NO BID 96,989.34 107,127.36 106,302.50

State Make and Model New Holland E37C

John Deere 35G

mini excavator Bobcat E35 minix ZTS JCB 8035ZTS

Hyndai R35Z-9A

excavator

303.5E2 Caterpillar

mini excavator

Case CX37c 

mini excavator    

John Deere 35G

mini excavator

D. Delivery Days MAKE/MODEL By: 8/25/17   30-90 days 30-150 days 90 days 170 days     

 

Net Net Net 0.50% Net Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

AG-PRO JCB of South TX Demandstar

Associated Supply Co. Mustant Equipment SAWS Website

Bill's Tractorr Nueces Power Equipment

Bobcat of SA RDO Equipment Co.

Equipment Depot Romco Equipment

Ewald Kubota Tractor City

Herc Rentals Tuttle Motor

Hlavinka Equipment Waukesha Pearce Ind.

Holt Texas
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